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tween students who may 
well be top performers 
and access to higher edu-
cation, in particular when 
lack of the Dutch nation-
ality gets in the way. 
  I Am SXM founder 
Member of Parliament 
(MP) Tamara Leonard 
described a situation of 
students falling through 
the cracks by not being 
eligible for Government 
scholarships. This even 
happens to local students 
who, through no fault of 
their own, are not Dutch 
nationals, even if they are 
born in St. Maarten to one 
or more foreign but tax-
paying parents. 
  The initiative aims to 
offer 10 scholarships at 
USM for academic-orient-
ed high school graduates, 
another five for a pre-
USM course for techni-
cal oriented students and 
three to five international 
scholarships. 
  This is provided enough 
funds are raised and 
Leonard said the idea had 
been very well received so 
far by the business com-
munity, a vital source of 
sponsorship. Leonard 
said some US $25,000 had 
been pledged during the 
first day of fundraising 
within the business com-
munity. 
  She also said both Min-
ister Bourne-Gumbs and 
USM President and In-
terim Dean of Academics 
Dr. Francio Guadeloupe 
had taken to the idea im-
mediately. 
  USM will support the 
project in a wide sense of 
the word, including con-
tributing to awareness and 
fundraising activities, and 
essentially offer the na-
tional rate regardless of a 
scholarship-receiver’s le-
gal status. One of the tasks 
stipulated in the MOU is 
that I Am SXM Founda-
tion/Education For Us All 
will provide guest lectur-
ers. 
  USM sees the agreement 
also as taking a vital step 
in tailoring its educational 
programmes to meet the 
needs of the island’s in-
habitants. 
  Dr. Guadeloupe said 
at the signing ceremony 
that part of making sure 
St. Maarten “remains a 
decent society” is ensur-
ing “human dignity and 
the ability to self-realise. 
Education is key” to that 
process and students 

should not be made to feel 
like second-class citizens 
through no fault of their 
own.
  Minister Bourne-Gumbs 
said the project, which she 
endorsed, fell in line with 
the ministry’s aims. She 
said the Ministry had to 
commit to certain guide-
lines, stick to criteria and 
deal with a tight budget, 
contributing to the reality 
of the situation. She com-
mended the parties for 
doing their part towards 
ensuring education and 
providing second chances. 
  She also suggested that 
funding should be made 
into a revolving system, so 
that more students could 
benefit, with less depen-
dency on fundraising. This 
would entail students pay-
ing back at least part of the 
scholarship, which would 
be geared towards con-
tinuing the programme
  Leonard said she origi-
nally had started I Am 
SXM during pre-elections 
as a campaign, but that 
the causes related to all 
of St. Maarten and were 

not meant to be divided by 
any political lines. Part of 
putting distance between 
the two concepts was the 
subsequent Education For 
Us All. 
  Education For Us All 
President Julian Lake said 
new education opportuni-
ties in principle provided 
much needed hope for 
youths and the chance to 
expand horizons. He en-
couraged students to ap-
ply. 
  Applications should be 
made through the I Am 
SXM Facebook page for 
now. Applicants who meet 
the criteria, also described 
in detail on that page, will 
be determined through a 
selection committee, man-
agement and a board. The 
shortlist of viable appli-
cants will be picked ran-
domly at a public event 
that also will serve as a 
fundraiser. As for the 
smaller number of inter-
national scholarships, one 
student also will be chosen 
by Art Saves Lives Foun-
dation. 

ST. EUSTATIUS--The 
heavy rains that lasted for 
hours on Thursday not only 
delivered some much-need-
ed water in empty cisterns, 
but also caused some dam-
age to the roads on St. Eu-
statius.
  Currently, road works are 
being carried out by a con-
tractor for the laying of un-
derground cables for St. Eu-
statius Utility Company’s 
(STUCO’s) solar energy 
park.

  The tropical wave, which 
passed through the region 
on Thursday, not only 
caused rainwater washing 
the dirt back in where it had 
been dug out, but one of the 
trenches on Queen Beatrix 
Street caved in under pres-
sure of the rushing water.
  The caved-in trench is lo-
cated in the vicinity of the 
Tax Office. Chief of Police 
Maurice van Velzen said 
Friday, that the area poses 
a significant risk for bodily 

harm should the street col-
lapse while someone is try-
ing to enter the Tax Office.
  “Not only would the fall 
pose a risk of injury, there 
is also loose concrete and 
asphalt that could poten-
tially land on top of them,” 
the Police Chief said, add-
ing that the street would be 
cordoned off with red-and-
white ribbon to alert the 
public that it was dangerous 
to cross the area.

MARIGOT--Gendarmes 
arrested two men suspected 
of shoplifting from Lacoste 
Boutique in West Indies 
Mall at around 5:00pm Fri-
day.
  The suspects appeared to 
have been arrested further 
down from the Mall close 
to La Vie en Rose Restau-
rant, as they were about to 
make their escape in a grey 
car.
  One well-dressed man in 
a blue shirt was handcuffed 

and put into a Gendarmer-
ie vehicle, and Gendarmes 
were seen holding some of 
the recovered stolen items.
  Commandant Sébastien 
Manzoni said he only had 
limited information, as the 
situation was still ongoing 
early in the evening.

  “This was a robbery with-
out weapons and there 
were no injuries,” he con-
firmed. “But there may be 
other persons involved and 
it is still evolving.”
  A car, possibly the one 
used by the thieves, was 
towed away from the scene.   
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The caved-in trench on Queen Beatrix Street.  

A man in a blue shirt is seen held by Gendarmes following a robbery in Lacoste Boutique in 
the West Indies Mall late Friday afternoon.
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